Tabulation of Bids

Contract No. 1: Force Main from Traverse City Regional WWTP to Garfield Rd.
East Bay Township Hall
September 15, 2025 at 2:00 PM

BASE BID ITEMS

Item M&M Excavating Team Elmer's Contractor
No. Description Quantity | Unit —— —— ——
Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1. |Audio-Video Route Survey 1 LSUM| $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 ([ $ 15,836.00 | $ 15,836.00 $ -
2. |Bypass Pumping 1 LSUM| $ 250,000.00 | $  250,000.00 | $ 122,820.00 | $ 122,820.00 $ -
3. |Connection to Existing Force Main 1 EA | $ 250,000.00 | $ 250,000.00 | $ 132,691.50 | $ 132,691.50 $ -
4. |Force Main, 16-inch Dia., HDPE, HDD 3,500 [ LFT |$ 1,050.00 | $ 3,675,000.00 | $ 960.55 | $ 3,361,925.00 $ -
5. |Force Main, 18-inch Dia., HDPE, HDD 1,546 | LFT | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,855,200.00 | $ 1,185.55 | $ 1,832,860.30 $ -
6. |Force Main, 16-inch Dia., HDPE, Bore and Jack 73 LFT | $ 6,000.00 | $  438,000.00 | $ 4,871.00 | $  355,583.00 $ -
7. |Air Release Valve and Structure, 16-inch Dia. 1 EA |$ 100,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 [ $ 176,068.00 | $ 176,068.00 $ -
8. |Two Way Cleanout, 16-inch Dia. 3 EA [$ 75,000.00|$ 225000.00 | $ 174,182.00 | $ 522,546.00 $ -
9. |Two Way Cleanout, 18-inch Dia. 1 EA |$ 100,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 192,920.00 | $ 192,920.00 $ -
10. |Maintenance Access Two Way Cleanout, 16-inch Dia. 1 EA |$ 100,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 [ $ 170,117.00 | $ 170,117.00 $ -
11. |Gate Valve and Structure, 16-inch Dia. 5 EA |$ 40,000.00 | $ 200,000.00 | $ 173,985.00 | $ 869,925.00 $ -
12. |Gate Valve and Structure, 18-inch Dia. 4 EA |$ 60,000.00 | $ 240,000.00 | $ 182,611.00 | $ 730,444.00 $ -
13. |Restoration, HDPE Force Main 5119 | LFT | $ 150.00 [ $  767,850.00 | $ 59.66 | $  305,399.54 $ -
TOTAL BASE CONTRACT PRICE (ltems 1 through 13) $ 8,226,050.00 $ 8,789,135.34 $ -
ALTERNATE BID
4A. |Force Main, 16-inch Dia., PVC, Direct Bury LFT No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd
5A. |Force Main, 18-inch Dia., PVC, Direct Bury LFT | No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd
6A. |Force Main, 16-inch Dia., PVC, Bore and Jack LFT No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd
13A. |Restoration, PVC Force Main LFT | No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd

Highlighted (in yellow) area indicates math error found during audit. Corrected amount shown.



