WADE
TRIM

Tabulation of Bids

Contract No. 2: Force Main from Garfield Road to Lift Station No. 1

BASE BID ITEMS

East Bay Township Hall

September 15, 2025 at 2:00 PM

Item Descriotion Quantity| Unit M&M Excavating Team Elmer's Walton Contracting
No. Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1. |Audio-Video Route Survey 1 LSUM| $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 [ $ 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 [ $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
2. |Bypass Pumping 1 LSUM| $ 250,000.00 [ $ 250,000.00 | $ 184,018.00 [ $ 184,018.00 | $ 97,000.00 | $ 97,000.00
3. |Connection to Existing Force Main 2 EA | $ 100,000.00 [ $ 200,000.00 | $ 153,329.00 [ $ 306,658.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 40,000.00
4. |Force Main, 16-inch Dia., HDPE, HDD 9,754 | LFT | $ 900.00 | $ 8,778,600.00 | $ 566.56 | $ 5,526,226.24 | $ 712.00 | $ 6,944,848.00
5. |Force Main, 16-inch Dia., HDPE, Bore and Jack 60 LFT [$ 6,000.00|$ 360,000.00 ($ 5554.00 % 333,240.00($ 1,250.00 | $ 75,000.00
6. |Air Release Valve and Structure, 16-inch Dia. 3 EA | $ 100,000.00 [ $ 300,000.00 | $ 167,088.00 | $ 501,264.00 | $ 40,739.00 [ $ 122,217.00
7. |Two Way Cleanout, 16-inch Dia. 8 EA |$ 75,000.00 ($ 600,000.00 | $ 165,792.00 | $ 1,326,336.00 | $ 44,990.75|$  359,926.00
8. |Maintenance Access Two Way Cleanout, 16-inch Dia. 2 EA [$ 10,000.00 [ $ 20,000.00 | $ 160,751.00 | $ 321,502.00 | $ 40,199.00 | $ 80,398.00
9. |Gate Valve and Structure, 14-inch Dia. 1 EA |$ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 162,092.00 | $ 162,092.00 | $ 41,316.00 | $ 41,316.00
10. |Gate Valve and Structure, 16-inch Dia. 7 EA |$ 40,000.00 |$ 280,000.00 | $ 164,762.00 | $ 1,153,334.00 | $ 44,327.25|% 310,290.75
11. |Restoration, HDPE Force Main 9,814 | LFT | $ 100.00 [ $ 981,400.00 | $ 59.66 | $ 585,503.24 | $ 42.00|$ 412,188.00
TOTAL BASE CONTRACT PRICE (ltems 1 through 11) $ 11,845,000.00 $10,412,173.48 $ 8,503,183.75
ALTERNATE BID
4A. [Force Main, 16-inch Dia., PVC, Direct Bury 9,754 LFT | No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd $ 460.00 | $ 4,486,840.00
5A. |Force Main, 16-inch Dia., PVC, Bore and Jack 60 LFT | No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd $ 1,250.00 | $ 75,000.00
11A. [Restoration, PVC Force Main 9,814 LFT | No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd No Bid Rec'd $ 32.00 | $ 314,048.00

Highlighted (in yellow) area indicates math error found during audit. Corrected amount shown.

Highlighted quantity for Item 4A has been corrected to match the base bid quantity. Quantity provided with the bid was 9,714 LFT.




